
IFB-25006 ROAD MATERIALS
BID TAB JULY 22, 2025-July 21, 2026

IFB-25006 Term Contract for Road 
Materials for Orange County
Awarded:July 22, 2025  VULCAN TEXAS MODERN WALLER P2

 CONSTRUCTION  MATERIALS/ CONCRETE COUNTY EMULSION
Contract Term: 07/22/2025 to 07/21/2026  MATERIALS a CRH CORPORATION

 LLC COMPANY SOUTH

1 AGGREGATE, (TY-PB GR 3), Bulk, Delivered

 $133.30/TON 
END DUMP 
TRAILER 

$90.95/DELIVERY $106.00/TON NO BID NO BID NO BID
 To PCT Yards in Orange County TX   RAIL DELIVERY 

2 AGGREGATE, (TY-PB GR 4), Bulk, Delivered 

 $132.30/ TON 
END DUMP 
TRAILER 

DELIVERY $105.00/TON NO BID NO BID NO BID

To PCT Yards in Orange County TX,  
 $89.95/TON RAIL 

DELIVERY 
To Job site in Orange County, TX 

3 ASPHALT, (CWE-2), Bulk, Delivered to Job Site
0 - 1000 Gallon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1001 to 2500 Gallon
2501 to 5000 Gallon
5001 Gallon + $3.29/GAL
TANKER DROP FEE $80.00
Demurrage, Extra Time spent waiting $80.00 

4 ASPHALT, (CWE-2), Bulk, @ Plant
0 - 1000 Gallon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1001 to 2500 Gallon
2501 to 5000 Gallon
5001 Gallon + $3.01/GAL
TANKER DROP FEE $80.00

5
HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE, (TYPE D) 
COLD LAID NO BID $130.00/TON NO BID NO BID NO BID
LAID, Bulk, @ Plant

6
HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE, (TYPE D) 
COLD LAID NO BID $140.00/TON NO BID NO BID NO BID
LAID, Bulk, Delivered @ Jobsite



IFB-25006 ROAD MATERIALS
BID TAB JULY 22, 2025-July 21, 2026

7
HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE, (TYPE D) 
COLD LAID NO BID $122.00/TON NO BID NO BID NO BID
HOT LAID, Bulk, @ Plant

IFB-25006 Term Contract for Road 
Materials for Orange County  VULCAN TEXAS MODERN WALLER P2
Awarded:July 22, 2025  CONSTRUCTION  MATERIALS/ CONCRETE COUNTY EMULSION

 MATERIALS a CRH CORPORATION
Contract Term: 07/22/2025 to 07/21/2026  LLC COMPANY SOUTH

8
HOT MIX ASPHALTIC CONCRETE, (TYPE D) 
COLD LAID NO BID $132.00/TON NO BID NO BID NO BID
LAID, Bulk, Delivered @ Jobsite

9 LIMESTONE BASE, GR 1 TY A, Bulk, $40.00/ TON $41.00/TON $37.99/TON NO BID NO BID
@ Hopper

10 LIMESTONE BASE, GR 1 TY A, Bulk, FOB $50.00/ TON $62.00/TON $48.99/TON NO BID NO BID
Delivered to Jobsite

11 LIMESTONE BASE, GR 2 TY A, Bulk $40.00/ TON $41.00/TON $37.99/TON NO BID NO BID
@ Hopper

12 LIMESTONE BASE, GR 2 TY A, Bulk FOB $50.00/TON $62.00/TON $48.99/TON NO BID NO BID
Delivered @ Jobsite

13 LIMESTONE 610 BASE                                         $50.00/ TON $60.00/TON $70.50/TON NO BID
Delivered @ Jobsite

14 LIMESTONE 610 BASE                                         $60.00/ TON $60.00/TON $70.50/TON NO BID NO BID
delivered @ to PCT Yards in Orange County TX

15 PUGMIX, Stabilized, 1.5 Sack, Bulk, NO BID $62.00/TON $47.00/TON NO BID NO BID
16 PUGMIX, Stabilized, 3 Sack, Bulk, @ Hopper NO BID $70.00/TON $58.50/TON NO BID
17 Asphaltic Concrete Patching Material

DMS-9202, High Performance Cold Mix             
delivered @ Hopper NO BID $150.00/TON NO BID $110.00/TON NO BID

18 P2 Road Stabilizer, Delivered to Job Site NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $721.95/TON    

$2.96/GAL

19
P2 (ROC) Road Over Coat, Delivered to Job 
Site NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $756.09/TON 

$3.10/GAL
20 Demurrage, Extra Time spent waiting NO BID $250.00/HR $135.00/HR NO BID $80.00/HR

Waller County Asphalt, Inc.
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22010 Fairgrounds Rd.
Hempstead, TX 77445
Att: Kyle Dawson
Phone: (979) 826-7075
infor@wcasphalt.com

Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC
P.O. Box 21557
Beaumont, TX 77720
Att: Jennifer Frederick 
Phone: (409) 291-7600
Email: jfrederick@modernconcretetx.com

Texas Materials, a CRH Company
12907 US Highway 90
Beaumont, TX 77713
Attn: Jeremy Hemmings
Phone (409) 718-8082
Jeremy.Hemmings@texasmaterials.com

P Squared Emulsion Plant LLC
516 South McLennan Loop
Elm Mott, Texas 76640
Att: David Willams
Phone (254) 829-0330
david@p2emulsions.com

Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC
P.O. BOX 791550
San Antonio, TX 78279
Att: Melanie Manrique
Phone: (210) 965-0448
manriquem@vmcmail.com

mailto:infor@wcasphalt.com
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